Logsdon, Jeremy

From: Murrie, Amy

Sent: Thursday, May 8, 2025 10:45 AM

To: Logsdon, Jeremy; Wilson, Ron

Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Dollar General Literacy Foundation Grant Announcement

Attachments: image001.png; 2025 DGLF Partner Grant Procedures.pdf; DGLF Partner Impact
Report_May 2025.docx

Jeremy,

Congratulations on your grant ! See the email below and let me know if you need anything else.

Amy Murrie

Begin forwarded message:

From: Victoria Morrison <vmorriso@dollargeneral.com>

Date: May 8, 2025 at 10:28:28 AM CDT

To: "Murrie, Amy" <Amy.Murrie@wku.edu>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Dollar General Literacy Foundation Grant Announcement

You don't often get email from vmorriso@dollargeneral.com. Learn why this is important

Hi Amy,

I’'m excited to share that our board reviewed and approved the grant “Adult Literacy Clinic” in the
amount of $40,000. We are proud to support your organization and appreciate the work you do each
day to serve teachers, students, and literacy programs.

Attached you’ll find a document outlining procedures and a few new requirements for 2025, including
the reporting process using the attached template.

Checks will be processed and mailed in the next few weeks. If your address or contact information has
changed since you submitted your grant, please contact reply to me with the new information ASAP.

Thanks!

Victoria Morrison

Corporate Social Responsibility & Philanthropy Specialist
100 Mission Ridge, Goodlettsville, TN 37072

P: 615-855-5415 E: vmorriso@dollargeneral.com




